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I am in Hong Kong now and will go back to back 

to England tomorrow. 
 
 On my first day here, I had dinner with my 
relatives. We had a delicious meal in our hotel. 
Then I went swimming. 
 

On the second day, I had breakfast in our hotel. 
Then, I went to Lantau Island. I visited the Big 
Buddha and Po Lin Monastery. In the afternoon, I 
went to a Chinese restaurant and ate Dim Sum. 
The food was yummy! Next, I went to Ocean Park. 
In Ocean Park, I went on some rides, watched the 
dolphin show and saw some birds. In the evening, I 
ate some seafood.  Then, I went to see the 
beautiful view of Victoria Harbour. Finally, I went 
shopping at nine o’clock and I bought some 
Chinese clothes. 
 

On the third day, I visited Hong Kong Wetland 
Park. I saw many different animals. In the 
afternoon, I ate Dim Sum in a Chinese restaurant. 
Then, I went to Ma Wan Park to visit Noah’s Ark. 
I saw many statues of different animals. In the 
evening, I went shopping at Stanley and I had 
dinner in our hotel.  
 

Tomorrow will be the forth day. I will pack up 
my things and leave Hong Kong. I had a lot of fun 
in Hong Kong. 


